
Bid Opening 3/24/09
SCHEDULE  #1 BIDDERS:

ITEM # EST.QUANTIT CHEMICAL: COYNE CHEMICAL UNIVAR USA INC BASIC CHEMICAL CUSTOM ENV.TECH.  HIBRETT PURATEX BUCKMAN'S INC KEMIRA COMPANY INCTIDEWATER PRODUCTS POLLU-TECH
3015 STATE ROAD 532 E. Emaus St. 5 Steel Road east 8 Iron Bridge Dr. 7001 Westfield Ave. 105 Airport Road 3211 Clinton Pkwy Ct PO Box 23181 853 2nd Street Pike

CROYDON, PA 19021 MIDDLETOWN, PA 17057MORRISVILLE PA 1906COLLEGEVILLE,PA 19426 PENNSAUKEN, NJ 08110 Pottstown PA 19464 Lawrence KS 66047 Toledo OH 43623 Richboro PA 18954

1 48,000 gal. Aluminum Sulfate 50% NO BID .927/gal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(min. 4,000 gal. del.)

2    500 gal. Aluminum Sulfate 50% 3.62 /gal 3.69/gal NO BID NO BID 3.25/gal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(15 - gal. deldrums) 10 drum del min. 9 drum del

3 15,000 lbs. Liquid Chlorine $ 110.04 /cyl $97.50 /Cylinder NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(150 lb. Cylinders) min 6 cyclinder del

4 20,000 gal. Sodium Hypochlorite 15%
(min. 2,500 gal del.) $ 1.23 /gal .988/gal $ 1.28 /gal NO BID NO BID $ 1.05 /gal NO BID NO BID NO BID
(min. 800 gal. del.) $ 1.68 /gal NO BID $ 1.46 /gal NO BID NO BID $ 1.31/gal NO BID NO BID NO BID

5  4,000 gal. Sodium Hypochlorite 15% 2.21 /gal 2.53/gal NO BID 2.15/gal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(54 gal. deldrums) min. 6 drum del min. 4 drum del

6  2,000 gal. Sodium Hypochlorite 15% $ 2.87 /gal $ 4.39 /gal NO BID NO BID 3.25/gal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(15 gal. deldrums) min 10 drum del min. 9 drum del

7  7,000 gal. Sodium Hydroxide 25% $ 2.02 /gal NO BID $ 1.76 /gal NO BID NO BID $ 1.73/gal NO BID NO BID NO BID
(min. 800 gal. del.) min. 800 gals del

8    500 gal. Sodium Hydroxide 25% 2.89 /gal 4.369/gal NO BID NO BID $ 3.75 /gal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(15 gal. deldrums) min. 10 deldrum del min. 9 drum del

9    800 gal. Liquid Enzymes NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(30 gal. container)

10 3,000 lbs. Sewer Cleaner NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(50 lb pail)

11 3,000 gal. Pump Station Degreaser NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 17.50/gal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(6 gal. container) 5% discount if 5 gal con

12 6,000 gal. Ferric Chloride 37-40% .4742 /dry lb. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ .60 /dry lb NO BID NO BID
(min. 3,800 gal. del.) $ 2.11 /gal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.82/gal NO BID NO BID

13 400 lbs. Calicum Hypochlorite 2.124/lb. min 2 pail del 2.59/lb NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1.69/LB NO BID NO BID NO BID
granular(min. 60%) 90 lb drum quoting on PPG Induclor 100# drum 100 lb drum del.

14 3,000 gal. Sodium Bisulfite (35.5%) 3.27 /gal NO BID $ 2.89 /gal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(min. 280 gal del) min. 280 gal del

15 1,000 gal. Caustic Potash 45% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.75/gal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(15 gal.drum) min 9 drum del

SCHEDULE #2
1 Cationic Emulsion Polymer 1.1689 /lb NO BID NO BID $ 1.33 /lb NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1.20 /lb $ 1.34 /lb

(zetag) zetag 8846 FS TWC-3701 Pollu-treatCL888

2 2,000 lbs. Anionic Emulsion Polymer 1.3887/lb NO BID NO BID 1.21 /lb NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1.20 /lb NO JAR TEST DONE
(magnafloc) Magnafloc E-40 TWA-3040

3 2,000lbs. Cationic Dry Polymer 2.0848 /lb Zetag 7565 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1.75 /lb $  2.04 /lb
Alternate=2.1118/lb Zetag 8125 TWC-7408 Pollu-treat C219

4 1,000 lbs. Anionic Dry Polymer 2.5667 /lb. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1.85 /lb $1.95 /lb
quoting on Magnafloc 155 TWA-730 Pollu-treat A27

Will be invoiced  at noted 
price if not returned in

good condition at end of K


